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Primary immunodeficiency diseases (PIDs) are a group of rare disFree
Downloads that affect the immune system. The immune system is
responsible for protecting the body from infections. In people with PIDs, the
immune system is unable to function properly, which can lead to recurrent
infections, autoimmune disFree Downloads, and other health problems.

Definition

PIDs are defined as disFree Downloads that affect the development or
function of the immune system. These disFree Downloads can be inherited
or acquired. Inherited PIDs are caused by mutations in genes that are
involved in the development or function of the immune system. Acquired
PIDs can be caused by a variety of factors, including infections, toxins, and
certain medications.

Symptoms
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The symptoms of PIDs can vary depending on the type of disFree
Download. However, some common symptoms include:

Recurrent infections

Autoimmune disFree Downloads

Allergies

Eczema

Asthma

Failure to thrive

Diagnosis

PIDs are diagnosed based on a combination of factors, including the
patient's medical history, physical examination, and laboratory tests. The
most common laboratory tests used to diagnose PIDs are blood tests and
immunological tests. Blood tests can measure the levels of antibodies and
other immune cells in the blood. Immunological tests can measure the
function of the immune system.

Management

The management of PIDs depends on the type of disFree Download.
However, some common treatments include:

Antibiotics

Immunoglobulin replacement therapy

Stem cell transplant



Gene therapy

Prognosis

The prognosis for PIDs varies depending on the type of disFree Download.
However, with early diagnosis and treatment, most people with PIDs can
live full and healthy lives.

PIDs are a group of rare disFree Downloads that can have a significant
impact on the health of those affected. However, with early diagnosis and
treatment, most people with PIDs can live full and healthy lives.
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